
Error Log Translation 
 
Successful Files 

 
All of the files will contain some information that will not be important in checking 
the error log.  Begin by looking for information that comes after the line titled --  
** START OF TRANSACTION SET 
Information above this line dealing with sources and destinations can be ignored. 
 
If, after this row, you see two lines indicating that there are zero errors (ERRORS 
= 0), then the file has been processed successfully and the claims are in the 
adjudication queue awaiting processing.  
 
At this time there is nothing more that needs to be done. 
 



Unsuccessful Files 
 

 
Again with an error log with errors there will be information that will not be 
important in checking the error log.  Begin by looking for information that comes 
after the line titled --  
** START OF TRANSACTION SET 
 
If there are errors you will see the errors documented below this line.  In the file 
above there are three errors.  All errors will appear above the ERROR = lines. 
Two in the pre-check and one in the post-check.  The error counts reflect this 
ERRORS = 2 and ERRORS = 1 
 
The file’s errors will need to be corrected and the entire file will need to be 
resubmitted to ABH. 
 
 
 
 



Reading Error Lines 
 

Below is an example of an error line: 
 
D6 : Data element type error (VD8..17) (D.E.1250 PO: 2 2400/DTP PO: 0152 ) 
RECORD #28 : DTP*472*RD8*Date-20050228 
 
D6: This element of the error line can be ignored. 
 
Data element type error:  The beginning of the line is the description of the 
error.  In this care the wrong type of data was submitted, instead of a date the 
word date was entered. 
 
(VD8..17):  This is the data type that the element should be.  VD or D=date, 
A=alphanumeric, and I=integer.  The number indicates the minimum and 
maximum length allowed.  In this case the minimum is eight and maximum is 17.  
 
(D.E. 1250:  This is the data element number (a number that is referenced in the 
national standards). 
 
PO: 2:  This is the position of the element within the error line. 
 
2400/DTP:  This is the loop and segment within file containing the error. 
 
PO:0152:  This number can be ignored, it references an internal mapping 
number. 
 
RECORD #28:  This is the line number of the line in the file submitted. 
 
DTP*472*RD8*Date-20050228:  This is an actual copy of the line of data that 
contained the error. 
 
All errors need to be corrected.  Once they are corrected, resubmit the file to 
ABH and the file will be checked.  Another error log will be created indicating if 
there are any additional errors. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


